
Yes it sold for $3760 and I deposited it Tuesday. I’ll send an email Monday. 

Sent from Bethany Shockney's iPhone 

Bethany T. Shockney, Executive Director 
Giles County Economic Development Commission 
203 South First Street
Pulaski, TN 38478
O: 931-363-9138
C: 931-205-1903
Bethany@gilescountyedc.com

On Jul 27, 2018, at 10:58 AM, David Rackley <David@davidrackley.com> wrote:

We forgot to mention the sale of the Explorer on Wednesday.   Is it gone?
If so, let everyone know what it brought and deposit that money into the
Restricted Assets account.

David Rackley
Rackley Technologies, LLC
P.O. Box 622/2303 Crescent View Rd
Pulaski, TN 38478
931-363-6922 Office ext 201
931-580-6995 Cell
david@rackleytechnologies.com

Chairman,
Pulaski/Giles County Economic Development Commission
http://www.gilescountyedc.com
EDC Office: 931-363-9138

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email and any files transmitted with it are
confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to
which they are addressed. If you are not the named addressee you should not
publicize, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail if you have received this email by mistake and delete
this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are
notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action based
on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. Any views or
opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not
necessarily represent those of the company.

Re: Explorer
Bethany Shockney 
to:
David Rackley
07/27/2018 05:07 PM
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